Begin forwarded message:

From: Golf <golf@shorehamvillage.com>

Subject: Swing for Shoreham Update for Wednesday meeting
Date: June 17, 2025 at 7:55:15 AM ADT

To: Elizabeth Finney <efinney@bellaliant.net>

Good Morning Liz,

Here is an update for you from the Golf Tournament:

Total Raised Golfers/ Sponsors $28,700.00

Lions Club Donation $1,000.00
Extra Sales Tickets- putting for lobster, Mulligans, Jersey $1,975.00

Total promised & Made $31,675.00
CGC Bill $10,024.00
signage $633.31
Birdease website $299.00
Thank you letter $43.30
Dessert $75.98
Costs out $11,075.59
Amount Made after costs $20,599.41

We are still waiting for two sponsorship payments, one is being paid by cheque by the Municipality and teh otehr
has requested to pay by e-transfer.

I've been advised by Tammy to make one e-transfer to finance@shoreham.com and am waiting for the
outstanding payment before transferring the outstanding funds raised of $695 for a total of $1195.

We had many generous donations for prizes, the biggest being $300 of lobster donated by Zink Fisheries! The
donated signed Brad Marchand Jersey fetched $600 in funds raised! Maybe next year | can secure a Panthers or
Leafs Jersey?

We had some Residents join us at registration to greet the golfers and have some Tim Hortons and then some
residents joined us at lunch and received a warm welcome from the crowd.

The Birdease website expires July 4thif you would like to renew it, it costs $299/ year. It is easy to use. The data can
be downloaded before that and all the invoices downloaded and saved incase folks loose their copy of the invoice.
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Chester Golf Course were gracious hosts. They were generous with their time and resources. We had 74 golfers
registered, one team not show up and CGC put in a team as well as donated 8 passes as prizing.

I still have Thank you letters to go out to the donations and another round of Thank you emails with invoices to the
players. | would like to connect with Shoreham and Northwood to do a large Thank you round up Post highlighting
sponsors, community prizing etc.

Could we include something like that on the website or newsletter as well?

| enjoyed being able to help a community of people that have been present in my life growing up in Hubbards and
going to school in Chester. This tournament is a big undertaking and requires and deserves a great deal of

attention and time.

| do not think that | am that person in this present season of my life going forward. | am more than happy to help
support future fundraising initiatives by way of volunteering, fundraising, gathering donations etc.

There are so many folks who have a lot of experience and want to help, a committee of well organized and time
able people my be something to look into.

This will not be my last report as | still have more final invoices to submit for approval, contact lists to provide,
donation contacts and social media posts to organize.

Thank you Liz for your support and the care that the fund provides for the Residents.

As always, feel free to call if you have any questions.

Warmly,

Amber
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